
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 13-6062

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Saw Blades 

FOR: Diamond Segmented

TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2014)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 15, 2013
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

130 ea. UNIT *  

Blade, Wheel Cuty 14 inch diamond 20mm Stihl SB80 Premium PRICE 167.99  ITEM 1   302.13  

No Substitute allowed, Arbor 20mm, Stihl SB80, SAWS No. 42168 TOTAL 21,838.70 NO BID NOT APPROVED NO BID NO BID 39,276.90 NO BID

1. Manufacturer/Part Number MFR/PART # Stihl/SB80 14"     Stihl/0835-090-2018  

50 ea. UNIT  *

Blade, Multi-Purpose, 14 inch diamond premium diamond tip, used for high speed PRICE 138.60 70.00 74.00 84.00 182.00 214.25 226.80

walk behind SAWS Arbor 1" cust concrete with rebar, asphalt and brick pavers SAWS No. 42224 TOTAL 6,930.00 3,500.00 3,700.00 4,200.00 9,100.00 10,712.50 11,340.00

2. Manufacturer/Part Number MFR/PART # Lackmon/STS5-14" Husgvarna HU1000 Bestcut/BC14BDS 1" Hilti/3507380 Dewalt/DW4742 OX Group OX-UC10-14 Diamond 84968

 

TOTAL 21,838.70 3,500.00 3,700.00 4,200.00 9,100.00 49,989.40 11,340.00

EXTENSION 1 21,838.70 3,500.00

EXTENSION 2 21,838.70 3,500.00

EXTENSION 3 21,838.70 3,500.00

 
Net Net Net Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 7 days 10 days 30 days 20 days 7-10 days 7 days

    

   

*LOW BIDDER  

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alamo Iron Works Industrial Supply Solutions Demandstar

ASCO Lackmond SAWS Website

Baytech Supply MSC Industrial Supply

Bestcut Mfr. Nations Rent

Bullard Abrasives PR Diamond

CMC Construction Services Sunbelt

Grainger Tool Mart

Hilti, Inc. United Tool & Fastener
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